

**CITY OF DAYTON, OHIO - PURCHASING DIVISION - BID TABULATION**

**For: MOBILE AERIAL EQUIPMENT INSPECTION, TESTING, REPAIRS AND RELATED SERVICES**

**Dept./Div.:PUBLIC WORKS / FLEET MANAGEMENT**

**IFB NO.: D18038**

**Requisition Nos.: 032PWF8**

**BID OPENING: 11:00 A.M.; 11-09-2018**

No.:		1	2	
BIDDER NAME & STREET ADDRESS:		AMERICAN TEST CENTER	DIVERSIFIED INSPECTIONS ITL INC.	
CITY:		RIVER FALLS	PHOENIX	
STATE & ZIP:		WI 54022	AZ 85069	
Recommended for Award		X		
QUALIFIES FOR LOCAL PREFERENCE?		NO	NO	
QUALIFIES FOR CERTIFIED PREFERENCE?		NO	NO	
LOCAL / CERTIFIED PREFERENCE A FACTOR IN AWARD?		NO	NO	
Item #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	U/M	UNIT COST	UNIT COST
<b>PLEASE READ ALL BID/PROPOSAL RESPONSES TO ENSURE THAT ALL INFORMATION RECEIVED FROM VENDOR IS REVIEWED AND USED IN EVALUATION PROCESS</b>				
1	Versalift SST 360I Aerial Device	Each	• \$310.00	\$395.00
	Inspection Services with Reports and Certification		• \$65.00	\$85.00
2	Versalift V0255 RV Aerial Device	Each	• \$310.00	\$395.00
	Inspection Services with Reports and Certification		• \$65.00	\$85.00
3	Versalift Vantel 29IH Aerial Device	Each	• \$310.00	\$395.00
	Inspection Services with Reports and Certification		• \$65.00	\$85.00
4	Challenger 3430 Aerial Device	Each	• \$310.00	\$300.00
	Inspection Services with Reports and Certification		• \$65.00	N/A
5	Challenger 3430 Aerial Device	Each	• \$310.00	\$300.00
	Inspection Services with Reports and Certification		• \$65.00	N/A
6	Versalift VST 50000102 Aerial Device	Each	• \$310.00	\$395.00
	Inspection Services with Reports and Certification		• \$65.00	\$85.00
7	Teco C-4-361P-TBEI Aerial Device	Each	• \$310.00	\$395.00
	Inspection Services with Reports and Certification		• \$65.00	\$85.00
8	Versalift VST-50001 Aerial Device	Each	• \$310.00	\$395.00
	Inspection Services with Reports and Certification		• \$65.00	\$85.00
9	Altec Crane AC18-706-H2	Each	• \$310.00	\$395.00
	Inspection Services with Reports and Certification		• \$65.00	N/A
10	Terex XT Pro 60/70 Aerial Bucket	Each	• \$310.00	\$395.00
	Inspection Services with Reports and Certification		• \$65.00	\$85.00
11	Manitex 18T Crane Model 26101	Each	• \$310.00	\$395.00
	Inspection Services with Reports and Certification		• \$65.00	N/A

CITY OF DAYTON, OHIO - PURCHASING DIVISION - BID TABULATION

For: MOBILE AERIAL EQUIPMENT INSPECTION, TESTING, REPAIRS AND RELATED SERVICES

Dept./Div.: PUBLIC WORKS / FLEET MANAGEMENT

IFB NO.: D18038

Requisition Nos.: 032PWF8

BID OPENING: 11:00 A.M.; 11-09-2018

No.:			1	2
BIDDER NAME & STREET ADDRESS:			AMERICAN TEST CENTER	DIVERSIFIED INSPECTIONS ITL INC.
CITY:			RIVER FALLS	PHOENIX
STATE & ZIP:			WI 54022	AZ 85069
Recommended for Award			X	
QUALIFIES FOR LOCAL PREFERENCE?			NO	NO
QUALIFIES FOR CERTIFIED PREFERENCE?			NO	NO
LOCAL / CERTIFIED PREFERENCE A FACTOR IN AWARD?			NO	NO
Item #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	U/M	UNIT COST	UNIT COST
12	Versalift Model Tel-29-IH	Each	• \$310.00	\$395.00
	Inspection Services with Reports and Certification		• \$65.00	\$85.00
13	Versalift VST 47	Each	• \$310.00	\$395.00
	Inspection Services with Reports and Certification		• \$65.00	\$85.00
14	Terrex BT 3870-S	Each	• \$310.00	\$395.00
	Inspection Services with Reports and Certification		• \$65.00	N/A
15	Versalift SST-37-EIH-01	Each	• \$310.00	\$395.00
	Inspection Services with Reports and Certification		• \$65.00	\$85.00
16	UNIC UR1504	Each	• \$310.00	\$395.00
	Inspection Services with Reports and Certification		• \$65.00	N/A
17	National Crane 500E2	Each	• \$310.00	\$395.00
	Inspection Services with Reports and Certification		• \$65.00	N/A
18	Labor Rates			
	Standard Work Hours	Hour		No Bid
	Non-Standard Work Hours	Hour		No Bid
	Week-end Work Hours	Hour		No Bid
	Holidays Work Hours	Hour		No Bid
	Firm Price Agreement Through December 31, 2019 YES / NO		YES	YES
	If NO, for how long?			
	Options to renew for additional 12-months January 1, 2020 through December 1, 2020 Maximum Percentage of increase		YES 0%	YES 0%
	Options to renew for additional 12-months January 1, 2021 through December 1, 2021 Maximum Percentage of increase		YES 0%	YES 0%
TERMS:			NET 30	NET 30
F.O.B.:			DEST	DEST
DELIVERY:			30 - 90 DAYS	30 - 60 DAYS

• = lowest bid X = vendor selected for award

**CITY OF DAYTON, OHIO - PURCHASING DIVISION - BID TABULATION**

**For: MOBILE AERIAL EQUIPMENT INSPECTION, TESTING, REPAIRS AND RELATED SERVICES**

**Dept./Div.:PUBLIC WORKS / FLEET MANAGEMENT**

**IFB NO.: D18038**

**Requisition Nos.: 032PWF8**

**BID OPENING: 11:00 A.M.; 11-09-2018**

<b>No.:</b>		<b>1</b>	<b>2</b>
<b>BIDDER NAME &amp; STREET ADDRESS:</b>		<b>AMERICAN TEST CENTER</b>	<b>DIVERSIFIED INSPECTIONS ITL INC.</b>
<b>CITY:</b>		<b>RIVER FALLS</b>	<b>PHOENIX</b>
<b>STATE &amp; ZIP:</b>		<b>WI 54022</b>	<b>AZ 85069</b>
<b>Recommended for Award</b>		<b>X</b>	
<b>QUALIFIES FOR LOCAL PREFERENCE?</b>		NO	NO
<b>QUALIFIES FOR CERTIFIED PREFERENCE?</b>		NO	NO
<b>LOCAL / CERTIFIED PREFERENCE A FACTOR IN AWARD?</b>		NO	NO
<b>Item #</b>	<b>ITEM DESCRIPTION</b>	<b>U/M</b>	<b>UNIT COST</b>

**THE FOLLOWING VENDORS WERE SOLICITED BUT DID NOT BID:**

- |  |  |   |
|--|--|---|
| HRC<br>Dayton OH 45402                                       | 6. Straight Up Equipment Co.<br>Columbus OH 43212  | 12. Altec<br>Columbus OH 43207                    |
| 1. Ohio Cat<br>Troy OH 45373                                 | 7. ProLift Industrial Equipment<br>Dayton OH 45424 | 13. Dayton Tractor & Crane<br>Xenia OH 45385      |
| 2. Utility Truck<br>Circleville OH 43113                     | 8. CJM Solutions<br>Columbus OH 43232              | 14. Miami Industrial Trucks<br>Dayton OH 45439    |
| 3. Supereior Aerial<br>Kent OH 44240                         | 9. Aerial Testing Co<br>Blue Ball PA 17506         | 15. Crane & Host Service<br>West Chester OH 45069 |
| 4. Buckeye Body<br>Columbus OH 43201                         | 10. Mobile Inspections LLC<br>Butler PA 16001      | 16. Laub Equipment Service<br>Galloway OH 43119   |
| 5. Premier Aerial and Fleet Inspections<br>Brighton MI 48116 | 11. Versalift<br>Bethlehem PA 18020                |   |