

CITY OF DAYTON, OHIO - PURCHASING DIVISION - BID TABULATION

For: Ammunition

Dept./Div.: Police

Requisition No.: 024DP9, 025DP9

IFB 19013S: Due 10:00 AM on April 5, 2019

BIDDER NAME & STREET ADDRESS:		No.:	1	2	3
			Arms Unlimited Inc.	Kiesler Police Supply, Inc.	Vance Outdoors, Inc.
CITY:			Las Vegas	Jeffersonville	Columbus
STATE & ZIP:			NV, 89118	IN, 47130	OH, 43224
Recommended for Award			X	X	X
QUALIFIES FOR LOCAL PREFERENCE?			NO	NO	NO
QUALIFIES FOR CERTIFIED PREFERENCE?			NO	NO	NO
LOCAL / CERTIFIED PREFERENCE A FACTOR IN AWARD?			NO	NO	NO
Item #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	U/M	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST
PLEASE READ ALL BID/PROPOSAL RESPONSES TO ENSURE THAT ALL INFORMATION RECEIVED FROM VENDOR IS REVIEWED AND USED IN EVALUATION PROCESS					
1	Federal #P9HST2 9MM, 147 gr. HST HP Pistol Ammunition	Case	No Bid	\$294.00	No Bid
2	Federal #BC9NT3 9MM, 100 gr. Frangible RHT Pistol Ammunition	Case	No Bid	\$395.00	No Bid
3	Federal #GM308M-500 168 gr., 308Win. Sierra Matchking BTHP	Case	No Bid	\$377.00	No Bid
4	Federal #FEDEA76239A AE 7.62x39 124 gr. FMJ BT, Rifle Ammunition	Case	No Bid	\$277.00	No Bid
5	Speer Lawman RHT #53395 155gr. .45 ACP Caliber Non-Toxic, Frangible Pistol Ammunition	Case	No Bid	\$513.00	No Bid
6	Speer Lawman #53653 230gr., .45 ACP TMJ Pistol Ammunition	Case	No Bid	\$262.00	No Bid
7	Remington LF129B00 / 20805 2 3/4 Frangible 12ga. 9 pellet 00Buckshot	Case	\$269.00	\$295.00	No Bid
8	Barnes Bullets VOR-TX #BB300AAC1, 300 AAC Blackout 110 gr, TAC-TX FB, Rifle Ammunition	Case	\$212.00	\$235.00	No Bid
9	Quantum Ammunition #300SRBLK-CAN-500 Interceptor 300	Case	No Bid	\$295.00	No Bid
10	Remington #L300AAC1, 300 AAC Blackout 120 gr., OTFB Rifle Ammunition	Case	\$120.00	\$135.00	No Bid
11	Remington REMI20300 12 ga. Slugger, Rifled 1 oz Slug	Case	\$156.000	\$111.00	No Bid
12	Remington #20636, FFLF12FSS25 RR LF 12RS, Frangible 12 ga. Slug	Case	\$267.000	\$289.00	No Bid
13	Defense Technologies / Safariland, Part #DT3027 12 ga, Drag Stabilized Round	Case	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,230.00
14	Secure Blank Loud 9mm Toxfree 5306001	Case	No Bid	\$192.00	\$176.0000
15	Secure Blank Quiet 9mm Toxfree 5306005	Case	No Bid	\$192.00	\$176.0000
16	9mm FX Red Marking Cartridge, 5320761, Lead Primers	Case	No Bid	\$255.00	\$233.7000
17	9mm FX Blue Marking Cartridge, 5320762, Lead Primers	Case	No Bid	\$255.00	\$233.7000
	Discount off list pricing for parts and related supplies		30%	2%	see State Term Pricing
	Price to remain firm through March 31, 2020?		YES	YES	YES
	Option to renew at same price for additional 12-months April 1, 2020 through March 31, 2021		YES	NO	NO
	Maximum Percentage of increase			0-10%	6%
	Option to renew at same price for additional 12-months April 1, 2021 through March 31, 2022		YES	NO	NO
	Maximum Percentage of increase			0-20%	12%
	Option to renew at same price for additional 12-months April 1, 2022 through March 31, 2023		YES	NO	NO
	Maximum Percentage of increase			0-30%	19%
TERMS:			Net 30	Net 30	Net 30

CITY OF DAYTON, OHIO - PURCHASING DIVISION - BID TABULATION

For: Ammunition

Dept./Div.: Police

Requisition No.: 024DP9, 025DP9

IFB 19013S: Due 10:00 AM on April 5, 2019

No.:		1	2	3	
BIDDER NAME & STREET ADDRESS:		Arms Unlimited Inc.	Kiesler Police Supply, Inc.	Vance Outdoors, Inc.	
CITY:		Las Vegas	Jeffersonville	Columbus	
STATE & ZIP:		NV, 89118	IN, 47130	OH, 43224	
Recommended for Award		X	X	X	
QUALIFIES FOR LOCAL PREFERENCE?		NO	NO	NO	
QUALIFIES FOR CERTIFIED PREFERENCE?		NO	NO	NO	
LOCAL / CERTIFIED PREFERENCE A FACTOR IN AWARD?		NO	NO	NO	
Item #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	U/M	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST
		FOB:	DEST	DEST	DEST
		DELIVERY:	60 DAYS ARO	30-240 DAYS ARO	10-60 DAYS ARO

• = lowest bid X = vendor selected for award

THE FOLLOWING VENDORS WERE SOLICITED BUT DID NOT BID:

- | | |
|-----------------------------|--|
| 1. US Tactical Supply | 3. Red Diamond Uniform & Police Supply |
| 2. Standard Law Enforcement | 4. ICC Ammo |