CITY OF DAYTON, OHIO - PURCHASING DIVISION - BID TABULATION

For: HERBICIDES, FERTILIZERS, INSECTICIDES, APPLICATION SERVICES AND RELATED ITEMS

Dept./Div.: VARIOUS IFB No.: 19009JL
Requisition No.: VARIOUS Bids Opened: 11:00 A.M.; 2-26-2019
No - 1 2 3 4 5 6
BIDDER NAME & STREET ADDRESS: ADVANCED TURF GREEN VELVET HARRELL'SLLC HELENA LEISURE LAWN SITEONE
SOLUTIONS SOD FARMS AGRI-ENTERPRISES LLC LANDSCAPE SUPPLY
CITY: FISHERS BELLBROOK LAKELAND COLUMBUS WEST CARROLLTON CLEVELAND
STATE & ZIP: IN 46038 OH 45305 FL 33815 OH 43228 OH 45449 OH 44114
Recommended for Award X
QUALIFIES FOR LOCAL PREFERENCE? NO NO NO NO NO NO
QUALIFIES FOR CERTIFIED PREFERENCE? NO NO NO NO NO NO
LOCAL / CERTIFIED PREFERENCE A FACTOR IN AWARD? NO NO NO NO NO NO
Iltem #| ITEM DESCRIPTION U/M UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST
PLEASE READ ALL BID/PROPOSAL RESPONSES TO ENSURE THAT ALL INFORMATION RECEIVED FROM VENDOR IS REVIEWED AND USED IN EVALUATION PROCESS
DIVISION OF GOLF
1 [Fertilizer with Dimension Per Ib N/A $0.3293 $0.42 No Bid $0.410 $0.302
Custom Application Fee Per Acre $18.00 $15.00 No Bid $90.00 $18.00
2 |Fertilizer with Merit Per Ib N/A $0.3661 $0.4924 No Bid $0.410 $0.354
Custom Application Fee Per Acre $18.00 $15.00 No Bid $90.00 $18.00
3 [Fall Fertilizer Per Ib N/A $0.3434 $0.424 No Bid $0.310 $0.307
Custom Application Fee Per Acre $18.00 $15.00 No Bid $90.00 $18.00
4 |Soluble Fertilizer Per bag $29.00 $18.95 $24.97 $19.25 No Bid $26.94
Ibs per bag 25 25 25 25 No Bid 25
5 |[Grass Seed Per b $2.50 $1.99 ° $1.69 No Bid No Bid $1.81
6 Lesco Flo Ultra Wetting Agent Per gal $80.00 No Bid $51.98 No Bid No Bid $39.00
7 |lprodione Fungicide Per gal $74.00 $44.50 $41.36 $41.00 No Bid $38.72
8 |Primo Growth Regulator Per gal $160.00 $105.88 $134.59 $110.00 No Bid $118.22
9 Apex 10 Per gal $36.00 $40.00 $28.46 $20.00 No Bid $54.62
10 |Glyphosate Per gal $18.00 $12.99 $14.07 $14.75 No Bid $13.14
11 |Bifenthrin Per gal $20.00 $39.44 $43.43 No Bid No Bid $44.02
12 |Megalex Per gal $44.00 $39.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.84
13 |Chelated Iron Per gal $92.00 $9.43 $14.56 $10.00 No Bid $7.10
14 |Spray Pattern Indicator Dye Per gal $54.00 $25.88 $43.87 $28.00 No Bid $17.40
15 |3-Way Herbicide Per gal $26.00 $20.44 $24.30 $25.00 No Bid $20.44
16 |2D Herbicide Per gal $155.00 $83.76 No Bid $75.00 No Bid $86.93
17 |Dimension Per gal No Bid $169.88 $231.50 $211.00 No Bid $229.00
DIV OF STREET MAINTENANCE & DEPT OF
AVIATION




CITY OF DAYTON, OHIO - PURCHASING DIVISION - BID TABULATION
For: HERBICIDES, FERTILIZERS, INSECTICIDES, APPLICATION SERVICES AND RELATED ITEMS

Dept./Div.: VARIOUS IFB No.: 19009JL
Requisition No.: VARIOUS Bids Opened: 11:00 A.M.; 2-26-2019
NoO.: 1 2 3 4 5 6
BIDDER NAME & STREET ADDRESS:| ADVANCED TURF GREEN VELVET HARRELL'SLLC HELENA LEISURE LAWN SITEONE
SOLUTIONS SOD FARMS AGRI-ENTERPRISES LLC LANDSCAPE SUPPLY
CITY: FISHERS BELLBROOK LAKELAND COLUMBUS WEST CARROLLTON CLEVELAND
STATE & ZIP: IN 46038 OH 45305 FL 33815 OH 43228 OH 45449 OH 44114
Recommended for Award X
QUALIFIES FOR LOCAL PREFERENCE? NO NO NO NO NO NO
QUALIFIES FOR CERTIFIED PREFERENCE? NO NO NO NO NO NO
LOCAL / CERTIFIED PREFERENCE A FACTOR IN AWARD? NO NO NO NO NO NO
Iltem # ITEM DESCRIPTION U/M UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST
18 [Oust XP Per gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ° $50.11
Per case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ® $1,202.64
19 [Rodeo Herbicide Per gal ° $18.00 $20.74 No Bid $21.00 No Bid $19.08
Per case $180.00 $103.70 No Bid $105.00 No Bid ° $95.38
20 |Roundup Pro Per gal $36.00 ° $12.68 $27.12 $14.75 No Bid $13.14
Per case $180.00 ° $63.40 $135.60 $73.75 No Bid $65.72
21 |[12-0-3 0.15% Dimension 25% SCU Per gal $17.00 ° $15.52 $23.17 No Bid No Bid $16.85
Ibs per bag 50 50 50 No Bid No Bid 50
22 |Cool Power Broadleaf Herbicide Per gal $66.00 ° $64.12 $75.98 $65.37 No Bid $67.62
Per case $330.00 ° $302.60 $379.90 $326.85 No Bid $338.10
23  |Qryzalin 4 Pro Per gal $56.00 ° $43.11 No Bid $45.00 No Bid $44.04
Per case $280.00 ° $215.55 No Bid $225.00 No Bid $220.22
24  |Gallery Herbicide Per Ib 157.44 ° $97.29 $127.50 $117.50 No Bid $127.50
Per case Per quart ° $389.16 $510.00 $470.00 No Bid $3,060.00
25 |Non lonic Surfactant Per gal $20.40 $15.16 $44.23 $13.00 No Bid ° $12.54
Per case $102.00 $75.80 $65.00 No Bid ° $62.68
26 |Turface Pro Per bag $9.95 $8.96 $12.16 No Bid No Bid ° $8.45
Ibs per bag 50 50 50 No Bid No Bid 50
27 |15-0-8 with Millennium Ultra Per bag $20.91 ° $17.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.06
Ibs per bag 40 40 No Bid No Bid No Bid 50
28 |[Sahara DG Per bag No Bid ° $46.67 No Bid No Bid No Bid $51.25
Ibs per bag No Bid 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid 5
29 [Millennium Ultra Per bag $20.91 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ° $16.82
Ibs per bag 40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30
30 |Millennium Ultra Liquid Per gal ° $82.50 ° $82.50 ° $82.50 ° $82.50 No Bid $84.30
Per case ° $412.50 ° $412.50 ° $412.50 ° $412.50 No Bid $421.48
31 |Tordon Per gal $100.00 $61.19 No Bid $73.00 No Bid ° $59.40
Per case $400.00 $305.95 No Bid $365.00 No Bid ° $178.20
32 |Dow Pathway Per gal No Bid No Bid No Bid ° $38.00 No Bid No Bid
Per case No Bid No Bid No Bid [ $190.00 No Bid No Bid
33 |Grass Seed - Sports Mix Grass Seed Per lb $1.80 $1.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid ° $1.37




CITY OF DAYTON, OHIO - PURCHASING DIVISION - BID TABULATION

For: HERBICIDES, FERTILIZERS, INSECTICIDES, APPLICATION SERVICES AND RELATED ITEMS
Dept./Div.: VARIOUS
Requisition No.: VARIOUS

IFB No.: 19009JL

Bids Opened: 11:00 A.M.; 2-26-2019

No.: 1 2 3 4 5 6
BIDDER NAME & STREET ADDRESS: ADVANCED TURF GREEN VELVET HARRELL'SLLC HELENA LEISURE LAWN SITEONE
SOLUTIONS SOD FARMS AGRI-ENTERPRISES LLC LANDSCAPE SUPPLY
CITY: FISHERS BELLBROOK LAKELAND COLUMBUS WEST CARROLLTON CLEVELAND
STATE & ZIP: IN 46038 OH 45305 FL 33815 OH 43228 OH 45449 OH 44114
Recommended for Award X
QUALIFIES FOR LOCAL PREFERENCE? NO NO NO NO NO NO
QUALIFIES FOR CERTIFIED PREFERENCE? NO NO NO NO NO NO
LOCAL / CERTIFIED PREFERENCE A FACTOR IN AWARD? NO NO NO NO NO NO
Iltem # ITEM DESCRIPTION U/M UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST
34 |Grass Seed - Perennial Rye Grass Per lb $1.50 $1.33 No Bid No Bid $1.08 $1.27
35 |Grass Seed - Kentucky Blue Grass Per |b $4.00 $2.31 No Bid No Bid $1.62 $2.36
36 |Grass Seed - Kentucky 31 Tall Fescue Per Ib $1.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.98 No Bid
37 |Grass Seed - Hybrid Power Tall Fescue 85/15 Per bag $90.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $69.40 $69.08
Ibs per bag 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 50 50
38 |Tordon 101 Per gal No Bid No Bid No Bid $73.00 No Bid No Bid
Per case No Bid No Bid No Bid $365.00 No Bid No Bid
39 |Grass Seed - Hybrid Power Tall Fescue 90/10 Per bag $90.00 $78.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid $69.08
Ibs per bag 50 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 50
40 |Grass Seed - Aggressor Mix Per bag $98.00 $78.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ibs per bag 50 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
41 |Quick Grass 4' x 180’ Per roll No Bid $30.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
42 |Quick Grass - 8' x 90' Per roll No Bid $51.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
43 |Surflan AS Per gal $56.00 $46.84 No Bid $54.00 No Bid $48.92
44  |Prodiamine 4L Per gal $80.00 $75.86 $73.41 $73.00 No Bid $77.67
45 |28-3-10 Turf Fertilizer Per bag $17.00 $13.95 $19.67 No Bid No Bid $17.04
Ibs. per bag 50 50 50 No Bid 50
46 |14-28-10 Starter Fertilizer Per bag $20.00 $12.88 $19.52 No Bid No Bid $17.41
Ibs. per bag 50 50 50 No Bid 50
47 |PennMulch Per bag $18.75 $16.99 No Bid $20.00 No Bid $13.95
Ibs. per bag 50 40 No Bid 50 No Bid 40
48 |Snapshot Per bag $85.00 $57.41 $113.01 $70.00 No Bid $71.18
Ibs. per bag 50 50 50 50 No Bid 50
49  |Florikan 3-4 month14-14-14 Plus Controlled Rele Per bag $26.00 $25.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.84
Ibs. per bag 50 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 40
50 |Peters Peat-Lite 20-10-20 Per bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ibs. per bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
51 |Bayer Finale Herbicide Per jug $165.00 $55.57 $130.00 $137.50 No Bid $142.36




CITY OF DAYTON, OHIO - PURCHASING DIVISION - BID TABULATION

For: HERBICIDES, FERTILIZERS, INSECTICIDES, APPLICATION SERVICES AND RELATED ITEMS
Dept./Div.: VARIOUS
Requisition No.: VARIOUS

IFB No.: 19009JL

Bids Opened: 11:00 A.M.; 2-26-2019

NoO.: 1 2 3 4 5 6
BIDDER NAME & STREET ADDRESS: ADVANCED TURF GREEN VELVET HARRELL'S LLC HELENA LEISURE LAWN SITEONE
SOLUTIONS SOD FARMS AGRI-ENTERPRISES LLC LANDSCAPE SUPPLY
CITY: FISHERS BELLBROOK LAKELAND COLUMBUS WEST CARROLLTON CLEVELAND
STATE & ZIP: IN 46038 OH 45305 FL 33815 OH 43228 OH 45449 OH 44114
Recommended for Award X
QUALIFIES FOR LOCAL PREFERENCE? NO NO NO NO NO NO
QUALIFIES FOR CERTIFIED PREFERENCE? NO NO NO NO NO NO
LOCAL / CERTIFIED PREFERENCE A FACTOR IN AWARD? NO NO NO NO NO NO
ltem # ITEM DESCRIPTION UM UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST
52 |T-NEX Plant Growth Regulator Per gal $160.00 $105.88 $134.59 $108.00 No Bid $118.22
53 |21-0-4 Turf Fertilizer with 0.2% Merit Per bag $22.00 $17.53 No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.14
Ibs. per bag 50 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 50
54  [12-24-12 with 3.5% Siduron Per bag No Bid $80.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid $87.89
Ibs. per bag No Bid 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 50
55 |32-3-5 All Minerall Fertilizer B160 Per bag $15.00 $12.78 No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.22
Ibs. per bag 50 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 50
56 |Freehand 1.75G Herbicide Per bag $92.15 $97.00 $92.00 $97.00 No Bid $92.15
Ibs. per bag 50 $37.50 50 50 No Bid 50
57 |Esplanade 200 SC Per gal No Bid No Bid No Bid ° $1,169.92 No Bid No Bid
Per case No Bid No Bid No Bid $5,849.60 No Bid No Bid
58 |[Garlon 3A Per gal No Bid $43.77 No Bid $53.00 No Bid $66.06
Per case No Bid $218.85 No Bid $265.00 No Bid $330.28
59 |Governor G PGR Per bag No Bid $30.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.51
Ibs. per bag No Bid 34 No Bid No Bid No Bid 34
60 |Plateau Per gal No Bid No Bid No Bid $131.00 No Bid $126.18
Per case No Bid No Bid No Bid ° $262.00 No Bid $630.90
61 |Roundup QuickPro Per jug $80.00 $80.66 No Bid $75.00 No Bid $66.22
Per case $320.00 $322.64 No Bid $300.00 No Bid $264.88
62 |Drive XLR8 Per 64 oz $70.00 $67.20 $83.17 $50.00 No Bid $39.54
Per case $280.00 $268.80 $332.68 $200.00 No Bid $158.16
63 |Tenacity Per gal $710.00 See Bid $697.00 ° $135.00 No Bid $697.00
Per case $1,420.00 $1,394.00 $1,080.00 No Bid $2,788.00
64 |[Sedgehammer+ Herbicide Per pack No Bid $8.50 $63.05 $8.33 No Bid $8.06
Per case No Bid $102.00 $630.50 $100.00 No Bid $96.72
65 |32-3-5 All Mineral Fertilizer Per bag No Bid $12.78 No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.22
Ibs. per bag No Bid 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 50
66 |Garlon 4 Per gal No Bid $48.98 No Bid $75.00 No Bid $59.86
Per case No Bid $195.92 No Bid $375.00 No Bid $299.28
67 |Milestone Per gal No Bid $365.00 No Bid ° $312.50 No Bid $363.91
Per case No Bid $1,825.00 No Bid ° $1,562.50 No Bid $1,819.54




CITY OF DAYTON, OHIO - PURCHASING DIVISION - BID TABULATION

For: HERBICIDES, FERTILIZERS, INSECTICIDES, APPLICATION SERVICES AND RELATED ITEMS
Dept./Div.: VARIOUS

Requisition No.: VARIOUS

IFB No.: 19009JL

Bids Opened: 11:00 A.M.; 2-26-2019

NoO.: 1 2 3 4 5 6
BIDDER NAME & STREET ADDRESS: ADVANCED TURF GREEN VELVET HARRELL'S LLC HELENA LEISURE LAWN SITEONE
SOLUTIONS SOD FARMS AGRI-ENTERPRISES LLC LANDSCAPE SUPPLY
CITY: FISHERS BELLBROOK LAKELAND COLUMBUS WEST CARROLLTON CLEVELAND
STATE & ZIP: IN 46038 OH 45305 FL 33815 OH 43228 OH 45449 OH 44114
Recommended for Award X
QUALIFIES FOR LOCAL PREFERENCE? NO NO NO NO NO NO
QUALIFIES FOR CERTIFIED PREFERENCE? NO NO NO NO NO NO
LOCAL / CERTIFIED PREFERENCE A FACTOR IN AWARD? NO NO NO NO NO NO
Item # ITEM DESCRIPTION U/M UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST
Firm Pricing Through February 29, 2020 NO
THROUGH 12-31-2019
Discount of Herbicides, Fertilizers, and Related
Supplies not listed herein 0% 0% 0% 0% 5% 10 - 20%
Discount of Grass Seeds not listed herein 0% 0% 0% 0% 5% 10 - 20%
Options to renew for additional 12-months
March 1, 2020 through February 28, 2021 NO NO YES NO YES NO
Maximum Percentage of increase 10%
TERMS: NET 30 NET 30 NET 30 NET 30 NET 30 NET 30
F.O.B.: DESTINATION DESTINATION DESTINATION DESTINATION DESTINATION DESTINATION
DELIVERY: 7 DAYS 10 DAYS 3-5 DAYS 7 DAYS DAYS DAYS
e = lowest Bid X = vendor selected for award
THE FOLLOWING VENDORS WERE SOLICITED BUT DID NOT Bid:
HRC
1. Scotts Lawn Service 7. Biosource Landscaping 13. Certified Labs
West Chester OH 45069 Xenia, OH 45385 Irving, TX 75015
2. Forestry Suppliers, Inc 8. NCH Corporation 14. Central Garden
Jackson MS 39284 Forth Worth, TX 75062 Madison, GA 30650
3. PondTech 9. Supply, Co 15. Southwest Landmark Inc.

Bethel OH 45106
4. CWC Chemical
Cloverdale, VA 24077
5. Trupointe
Springfield, OH 45503
6. Hill Manufacturing
Atlanta, GA 30315

Cincinnati, OH 45240
10. PondTech

Bethel, OH 45106
11. NCH

Irving, TX, 75062

12. Carso Inc
Camargo, IL 61919

16. Turfgrass South

Lebanon, OH 45036

Florence, KY 41042




